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China Global Television Network (redirect from CGTN)

China Global Television Network (CGTN) is one of three branches of state-run China Media Group and the
international division of China Central Television...

CGTN (TV channel)

CGTN is the English-language news channel of state-run China Global Television Network, based in
Beijing, China. It is one of several channels provided...

CGTN America

CGTN America is a channel of China Global Television Network (CGTN), the international division of the
state-owned media organization China Media Group...

CGTN (disambiguation)

China. CGTN channels include: CGTN (TV channel), the English-language news channel. CGTN
Documentary, the English-language documentary channel. CGTN Spanish...

CGTN Documentary

CGTN Documentary (formerly CCTV-9 Documentary) is a state-run English-language documentary channel
operated by the China Global Television Network (CGTN)...

CGTN Spanish

CGTN Spanish (Spanish: CGTN Español, formerly CCTV International Spanish or CCTV-Español and
CCTV-E) is the Spanish language entertainment and news channel...

CGTN Arabic

CGTN Arabic (Arabic: ?? ?? ?? ?? ???????), formerly CCTV-Arabic (Arabic: ?? ?? ?? ?? ???????), is an
Arabic language television channel owned by China...

CGTN French

CGTN French (formerly CCTV International French or CCTV-Français formerly CCTV-F is a French
language entertainment and news channel of China Central Television...

CGTN Africa

CGTN Africa is the African division of China Global Television Network (CGTN), the English-language
news channel run by Chinese state media outlet China...

CGTN Russian



CGTN Russian (formerly CCTV International Russian (Russian: ??????????? ??????????? ?????
????????????? ????? ?? P?????? ?????, Tsentral&#039;noye Televideniye...

Kioumars Pourhashemi

complained about the poor state of their units. According to eyewitnesses and CGTN, the dispute ultimately
escalated into violence when one Syrian officer shot...

Ofcom (section CGTN)

2019, Ofcom began an investigation into the Chinese international channel CGTN, owned by state
broadcaster China Central Television (CCTV), following allegations...

China Central Television

foreign language services were spun off into China Global Television Network (CGTN). CCTV and
Uzbekistan&#039;s National Television and Radio Corporation (UzTRK)...

Anand Naidoo

Anand Naidoo is a South African television anchor and correspondent for CGTN America based in
Washington, DC. Naidoo began his career as a newspaper journalist...

List of state media by country

&quot;???????&quot;|CGTN) CGTN — International news (in English) CGTN Documentary – International
documentary (in English) CGTN French — International (in French) CGTN Spanish...

Liu Xin (news anchor)

China Global Television Network (CGTN), now hosting the opinion show named The Point with Liu Xin on
weekdays at CGTN. She is fluent in Mandarin, English...

List of television stations in Thailand

CNA CNN International CTV CCTV 4 Asia CCTV 8 Drama CGTN CGTN Arabic CGTN Español CGTN
Français CGTN ??????? CNBC Asia Crime &amp; Investigation Network DD...

Cheng Lei (journalist)

Global Television Network (CGTN) in Beijing from 2012 to 2020 and also hosted the Global Business
program which airs on CGTN. She had previously worked...

James Chau

presenting forced confessions while working for Chinese state-run broadcaster CGTN. Chau is from West
London. His father was born in Hong Kong, while his mother...

United States cable news (section CGTN America)

Cgetd



for CGTN. The channel is carried on DirecTV, Dish Network, AT&amp;T U-Verse and smaller carriers and
live streams via its website and Livestream. CGTN has...
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